Bid Tabulation
Regina Johnson, Principal Buyer
Email: johnsonre@jccal.org

1 2
KIRKPATRICK CONCRETE, INC. KIRKPATRICK CONCRETE, INC. - Negotiated
[ GRAND TOTAL $ 514,182.50 | $ 513,882.50
m ]| Description Qty. UoM Mfg. Product No. Unit Price Ext. Total Mfg. Product No. Unit Price Ext. Total
1 |2000 PSI Ready Mix Concrete 500 [CuYd KCI TBD $ 102.00 | $ 51,000.00 KCI TBD $ 102.00 [ § 51,000.00
2 |3000 PSI Ready Mix Concrete 2000 |CuYd KCI TBD $ 105.00 | $  210,000.00 KCI TBD $ 105.00 [ § 210,000.00
3 |3500 PSI Ready Mix Concrete 400 |CuYd KCI TBD $ 107.50 | § 43,000.00 KCI TBD $ 107.50 [ $ 43,000.00
4 [4000 PSI Ready Mix Concrete 1000 |CuYd KCI TBD $ 110.00 | $  110,000.00 KCI TBD $ 110.00 [ § 110,000.00
5 |A-1-A Ready Mix Concrete 700 [CuYd TBD TBD $ 120.00 | $ 84,000.00 TBD TBD $ 120.00 | § 84,000.00
6 |Plasticizer Additive 600 [CuYd Grace TBD $ 8.00 | $ 4,800.00 Grace TBD $ 750 [ $ 4,500.00
7 |1% Accelerator Additive 600 |CuYd Grace TBD $ 6.00 | $ 3,600.00 Grace TBD S 6.00 |8 3,600.00
8 12% Accelerator Additive 600 [CuYd Grace TBD $ 12.00 | $ 7,200.00 Grace TBD $ 12.00 | $ 7,200.00
9 |Hot Water Additive 1000 [CuYd TBD TBD NO BID NO BID TBD TBD NO BID NO BID
10[{Cold Water Additive 1000 [CuYd TBD TBD NO BID NO BID TBD TBD NO BID NO BID
2000 PSI Ready Mix Concrete (1 —3 Cu Yd -
1 Small Job) ! Cuvd K1 TBD $ 140.00 | $ 140.00 KCl TBD $ 140.00 | $ 140.00
3000 PSI Ready Mix Concrete (1 —3 Cu Yd —
12 Small Job) ! CuYd Kt TBD $ 145.00 | § 145.00 Kcl TBD $ 145.00 | $ 145.00
3500 PSI Ready Mix Concrete (1 —3 Cu Yd -
13 Small Job) ! Cuvd K1 TBD $ 147.50 | $ 147.50 KCl TBD $ 147.50 | $ 147.50
4000 PSI Ready Mix Concrete (1 —3 Cu Yd -
14 Small Job) ! CuYd Kt TBD $ 150.00 | $ 150.00 Kcl TBD $ 150.00 | $ 150.00
Exact Transporation Charges $30.00/Load $30.00/Load
Delivery is guranteed not later than __ days after order date. 0 0
Guranteed maximum discount if contract is renewed for 2nd year 0% 0%
Guranteed maximum discount if contract is renewed for 3rd year 0% 0%
Required Forms
Bid Form Yes
Bid Bond / Cashier's Check Yes
Addendum No. 1 No
Notification of Intent to Respond No *Submitted with Bid Package
Non-Collusion Affidavit Yes
Affidavit of Contractor Yes
EEOC Yes
Statement of Commpliance Yes
Debarment Statement Yes
Signature Page Yes
PACA Form(s) Yes
Contact Information
1 lKirkpatrick Concrete 2909 3rd Ave. N., Birmingham, AL 35202 | Contact Person Hunter Worley, Phone: 205.323.8394, Email: hunter.worley@kirkpatrickconcrete.com
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